AMENDMENT TO THE SENATE AMENDMENT
TO H.R. 5376
OFFERED BY MR. MURPHY OF NORTH CAROLINA

At the end of section 11004, insert the following:

SEC. 11005. EQUALIZING THE NEGOTIATION PERIOD BETWEEN
SMALL-MOLECULE AND BIOLOGIC CANDIDATES UNDER THE
DRUG PRICE NEGOTIATION PROGRAM

Part E of title XI of the Social Security Act, as added by section 11001, is

amended—

(1) in section 1192(e)(1)(A)(i1), by striking ‘7 years’’ and inserting ‘11 years’’;
7and (2) in section 1194(g)(1)(A), by striking ‘9 years’’ and inserting ‘13 years’’.



